F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

20-20041

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM £
P. 0. BOX 2449 - 8 <
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 e 2 e
TABULATION OF BIDS g 5 5 g g -
PROPOSAL Purchase of Large Diameter CSC Repair Materials for “é E : @ § §
FOR: L301 & B303 Adapters ‘; % j% ';E % ;
TIME & % § ﬂ‘: E ":—z i_:
DATE 3:00 p.m., May 28, 2020 RO go s _2
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY ﬁ 2 6 M : g £
GROUP 1 |CSC L301 FR CLOSURE PKG UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 14,100.00 NO BID
1. 24-INCH L301 FR CLOSURE PKG (20' LL) TOTAL 14,100.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 16,858.00 NO BID
2. 30-INCH L301 FR CLOSURE PKG (20' LL) TOTAL 16,858.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 19,780.00 NO BID
3. 36-INCH 24 L301 FR CLOSURE PKG (20' LL) TOTAL 19,780.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 26,542.00 NO BID
4. 42-INCH 24 L301 FR CLOSURE PKG (20' LL) TOTAL 26,542.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 30,194.00 NO BID
5. 48-INCH 24 L301 FR CLOSURE PKG (20' LL) TOTAL 30,194.00
*
TOTAL GROUP 1 TOTAL 107,474.00 NO BID
GROUP 2 |L301 REPAIR SADDLE UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 3,316.00 4,180.00
1. 24-INCH L301 REPAIR SADDLE TOTAL 3,316.00 4,180.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 3,440.00 4,266.00
2. 30-INCH L301 REPAIR SADDLE TOTAL 3,440.00 4,266.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 3,769.00 4,570.00
3. 36-INCH L301 REPAIR SADDLE TOTAL 3,769.00 4,570.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 4,417.00 5,490.00
4. 42-INCH L301 REPAIR SADDLE TOTAL 4,417.00 5,490.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 5,180.00 5,783.00
5. 48-INCH L301 REPAIR SADDLE TOTAL 5,180.00 5,783.00
*
TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 20,122.00 24,289.00
GROUP 3 |SDR-26 PVC PIPE (20' JOINTS) UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 378.00 554.00
1. 24-INCH B303 Butt-Strap TOTAL 378.00 554.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 482.00 613.00
2. 30-INCH B303 Butt-Strap TOTAL 482.00 613.00
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DATE 3:00 p.m., May 28, 2020 g o K %% _x
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY ﬁ 2 5 M : 2 £
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 560.00 663.00
3. 36-INCH B303 Butt-Strap TOTAL 560.00 663.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 708.00 729.00
4. 42-INCH B303 Butt-Strap TOTAL 708.00 729.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 788.00 761.00
5. 48-INCH B303 Butt-Strap TOTAL 788.00 761.00
*
TOTAL GROUP 3 TOTAL 2,916.00 3,320.00
GROUP 4 |CSC WORC UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 2,582.00 2,038.00
1. 24-INCH B303 WORC TOTAL 2,582.00 2,038.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 2,872.00 2,151.00
2. 30-INCH B303 WORC TOTAL 2,872.00 2,151.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 3,216.00 2,595.00
3. 36-INCH B303 WORC TOTAL 3,216.00 2,595.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 4,026.00 3,272.00
4. 42-INCH B303 WORC TOTAL 4,026.00 3,272.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 4,456.00 3,656.00
5. 48-INCH B303 WORC TOTAL 4,456.00 3,656.00
UNIT *
PRICE
TOTAL GROUP 4 TOTAL 17,152.00 13,712.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 3,316.00 4,180.00
1. 24-INCH B303 REPAIR SADDLE TOTAL 3,316.00 4,180.00
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DATE 3:00 p.m., May 28, 2020 g o K go S _ 5
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY ﬁ 2 5 M : % £
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 3,440.00 4,266.00
2. 30-INCH B303 REPAIR SADDLE TOTAL 3,440.00 4,266.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 3,769.00 4,570.00
3. 36-INCH B303 REPAIR SADDLE TOTAL 3,769.00 4,570.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 4,417.00 5,490.00
4. 42-INCH B303 REPAIR SADDLE TOTAL 4,417.00 5,490.00
UNIT
1 ea. PRICE 5,180.00 5,783.00
5. 48-INCH B303 REPAIR SADDLE TOTAL 5,180.00 5,783.00
UNIT *
PRICE
TOTAL GROUP 5 TOTAL 20,122.00 24,289.00
TOTAL AWARD PER GROUP TOTAL 150,634.00 13,712.00
Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days
*LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATION E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Act Pipe Iconix Demandstar
Brad Greer Assoc KLP Commercial SAWS Website
Core and Main Morrison
Ferguson Rangeline Pipeline Services
Fortiline Scruggs
Gajeske Techline Pipe

Hughes Supplies Thompson Pipe Group
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